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The High Court’s 2018 decision in Burns v Corbett1 establishes that State tribunals that are 
not courts cannot exercise judicial power in matters of the kinds identified in ss 75 and 76 
of the Constitution. While not unexpected,2 the decision has the potential to cause 
widespread disruption to the work of State tribunals. This article explains the consequences 
of Burns v Corbett for State tribunals and considers seven options States may wish to 
pursue in response to the decision.  

It is convenient, at the outset, to clarify some terms that will be used throughout this article. 
The first two have an established technical meaning. ‘Federal jurisdiction’ is authority to 
exercise judicial power conferred by the Constitution or by Commonwealth laws. With the 
exception of the High Court’s appellate jurisdiction,3 federal jurisdiction is limited to the 
classes of matters identified in ss 75 and 76 of the Constitution. ‘State jurisdiction’ is the 
authority to decide conferred by State laws.4 The next two terms are non-technical phrases 
adopted in this article for convenience. We use the term ‘federal matters’ to refer to matters 
of the kinds identified in ss 75 and 76, irrespective of the source of jurisdiction. Finally, we 
will use the term ‘non-judicial tribunal’ to refer to a tribunal that is not a court.  

Burns v Corbett was not about the exercise of federal jurisdiction by State non-judicial 
tribunals. It is clearly unconstitutional for a non-judicial tribunal to exercise federal 
jurisdiction.5 The issue in Burns v Corbett was whether a State non-judicial tribunal could 
exercise State jurisdiction in a federal matter. The High Court held it could not.  

This article examines the reasoning of the Court in Burns v Corbett and then explains the 
consequences of the decision for the States. Finally, it identifies some possible reform 
options for State governments.  

The decision in Burns v Corbett 

In Burns v Corbett, the High Court unanimously held that State tribunals that are not State 
courts cannot exercise judicial power with respect to any of the classes of matters listed in 
ss 75 and 76 of the Constitution.  
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A majority of the Court, comprising Kiefel CJ and Bell, Gageler and Keane JJ, held that 
Ch III of the Commonwealth Constitution contains an implied limit on State legislative 
power: State parliaments have no power to confer judicial power with respect to the matters 
in ss 75 and 76 on non-court State tribunals. 

The joint judgment of Kiefel CJ and Bell and Keane JJ emphasised the exhaustive nature 
of Ch III of the Constitution in various respects and the negative implications that had been 
held to arise from it. The majority acknowledged that s 77(ii) itself ‘recognises the possibility 
that, absent Commonwealth legislation excluding the adjudicative authority that otherwise 
belongs to the State courts, that authority may continue to be exercised by those courts’.6 
However, the same was not true of non-court State tribunals. 

Their Honours considered that: 

the approach to the interpretation of Ch III, whereby the statement of what may be done is taken to 
deny that it may be done otherwise, is also apt to deny the possibility that any matter referred to in  
ss 75 and 76 might be adjudicated by an organ of government, federal or State, other than a court 
referred to in Ch III.7 

Chapter III expressly contemplates the exercise of adjudicative authority with respect to 
federal matters by: 

 the High Court, exercising the (federal) jurisdiction conferred on it by the Constitution  
(s 75); 

 the High Court, exercising the (federal) jurisdiction conferred on it by laws of the 
Commonwealth Parliament (s 76); 

 other federal courts created by the Parliament, exercising the (federal) jurisdiction 
conferred on them by laws of the Commonwealth Parliament (s 77(i)); 

 the courts of the States, exercising the (State) jurisdiction that otherwise belongs to them 
under the laws of the States (s 77(ii)); and 

 the courts of the States, exercising the (federal) jurisdiction invested in them by the 
Commonwealth Parliament. 

Kiefel CJ and Bell and Keane JJ considered that Ch III must be taken to be an exhaustive 
statement not only of the adjudicative authority of State courts but also of any organ of 
government, federal or State. An important structural consideration supporting this 
conclusion was the scheme of appeals from State courts exercising federal jurisdiction, 
subject only to exceptions and regulations prescribed by the Commonwealth Parliament.8 
That scheme would be undermined if States could invest judicial power in tribunals from 
which no appeal necessarily lay to a State court. 

Kiefel CJ and Bell and Keane JJ held that they did not need to consider the s 109 
inconsistency issue, because the question of whether an implication was to be drawn from 
Ch III was ‘logically anterior to any question as to the power of the Commonwealth 
Parliament to override such a conferral of adjudicative authority by a State Parliament’.9 

Justice Gageler expressed general agreement with the conclusions of Kiefel CJ and  
Bell and Keane JJ and ‘substantial’ agreement with their Honours’ reasoning.10 In contrast 
to the joint judgment, however, Gageler J explicitly considered the s 109 inconsistency 
argument first. Justice Gageler explained that, in order for an inconsistency to arise 
between s 39(2) of the Judiciary Act 1903 (Cth) and a State law conferring jurisdiction over 
federal matters on a non-court State tribunal, the Commonwealth law must first be taken to 
legislate exhaustively within a particular ‘universe’. Whether it could do so depended upon 
the scope of the legislative power conferred on the Commonwealth Parliament. 
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Justice Gageler held that s 39(2) of the Judiciary Act could not have a ‘negative penumbra’ 
excluding jurisdiction from non-court State tribunals, because s 39(2) was enacted pursuant 
to s 77(iii) of the Constitution and s 77(ii) and (iii) referred only to State courts.11 Nor could 
the incidental power, in s 51(xxxix) of the Constitution, support a law excluding the 
jurisdiction of State tribunals.12 His Honour thus concluded that the Commonwealth 
Parliament had no power ‘to exclude the adjudicative authority of non-court  
State tribunals’.13 

For Gageler J, this conclusion strengthened the structural considerations in support of the 
Ch III implication, because it meant that ‘that question falls to be considered against the 
background of an absence of Commonwealth legislative power to achieve the same 
result’.14 If the Ch III implication were not drawn, there would be ‘a hole in the structure of 
Ch III’ and ‘[t]he Commonwealth Parliament would have no capacity to plug it’.15 If the 
Commonwealth Parliament had had power to exclude the jurisdiction of non-court State 
tribunals then it might be said that the Ch III implication was unnecessary because — 
consistently with the apparent purpose of s 77(ii) and not inconsistently with the structure of 
appeals to the High Court under s 73 being subject to exceptions prescribed by the 
Commonwealth Parliament — the Commonwealth Parliament retained control over the 
organs capable of exercising judicial power in federal matters.16 

The remaining justices — Nettle, Gordon and Edelman JJ — each held that, while State 
parliaments did not lack legislative power to confer such jurisdiction on non-court State 
tribunals, the operation of State laws which purported to do so was excluded by a law of the 
Commonwealth Parliament — s 39(2) of the Judiciary Act 1903 (Cth) — which invests 
federal jurisdiction in State courts.17 The minority held that the Commonwealth Parliament, 
by enacting s 39(2), had evinced an intention that the only bodies capable of exercising 
judicial power in matters of the kinds listed in ss 75 and 76 of the Constitution should be 
federal courts and State courts. For Nettle and Gordon JJ, a State law which conferred 
judicial power on non-court State tribunals in respect of matters of those kinds was 
inconsistent with the Commonwealth law and so was invalid by operation of s 109 of the 
Constitution.18 For Edelman J, ss 38 and 39 of the Judiciary Act operated directly to 
exclude the jurisdiction of State courts.19 

The consequences of Burns v Corbett for State tribunals 

After Burns v Corbett, it is clear that a constitutional implication exists, according to which a 
State tribunal lacks jurisdiction to determine a matter in the following circumstances:  

 the matter falls within one of the descriptions in ss 75 and 76; and 
 the tribunal exercises judicial power in the determination of the matter; and  
 the tribunal is not a court. 

Each of these elements requires elaboration. 

Federal matters 

Matters affected by Burns v Corbett are those identified in ss 75 and 76 of the Constitution. 
Section 75 confers original jurisdiction on the High Court in all matters:  

(i) arising under any treaty; 

(ii) affecting consuls or other representatives of other countries;  
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(iii) in which the Commonwealth, or a person suing or being sued on behalf of the Commonwealth, is 
a party;  

(iv) between States, or between residents of different States, or between a State and a resident of 
another State;  

(v) in which a writ of Mandamus or prohibition or an injunction is sought against an officer of  
the Commonwealth. 

Section 76 empowers the Commonwealth Parliament to confer original jurisdiction on the 
High Court in matters:  

(i) arising under this Constitution, or involving its interpretation;  

(ii) arising under any laws made by the Parliament;  

(iii) of admiralty and maritime jurisdiction;  

(iv) relating to the same subject-matter claimed under the laws of different States.  

The matters in ss 75 and 76 — ‘federal matters’ — include some matters in respect of 
which State jurisdiction has never existed; for example, s 75(v).20 But, equally clearly, State 
jurisdiction could exist in some classes of ‘federal matter’ — for example, s 75(iv).   

The cases in which the constitutional issue in Burns v Corbett has arisen show how easy it 
is for federal matters to arise in State tribunals. 

Perhaps the most obvious possibility is the so-called diversity jurisdiction in s 75(iv), which 
includes matters between residents of different States. Residential tenancies disputes, for 
example, between a local tenant and an interstate landlord are not unusual in State 
tribunals. Burns v Corbett itself involved a complaint, in a tribunal’s anti-discrimination 
jurisdiction, by a resident of New South Wales against residents of Queensland and 
Victoria. Matters in diversity jurisdiction may account for a significant proportion of the 
caseload of some tribunals. However, there are several important limits on the diversity 
jurisdiction. The jurisdiction does not catch matters between a resident of a State and a 
corporation in another State21 or, indeed, any matter in which an artificial person is a 
party.22 Nor is the jurisdiction attracted when at least one party on either side of a dispute 
comes from the same State, even if residents of other States are also parties.23 

Slightly more unusual, but clearly possible, is a matter arising under a law made by the 
federal Parliament and therefore falling within s 76(ii). State tribunals, of course, exercise 
jurisdiction under State legislation. But there may be cases in which a State tribunal, in the 
exercise of those powers, is required to apply Commonwealth legislation. An example is 
Qantas Airways Ltd v Lustig.24 Mr Lustig commenced proceedings against Qantas in the 
civil claims division of the Victorian Civil and Administrative Tribunal (VCAT) seeking 
various orders including damages, an apology and 10 million frequent flyer points.  
Mr Lustig’s grievance arose out of an altercation that occurred when he was boarding a 
plane some six years earlier. Qantas invoked provisions of the Civil Aviation (Carriers’ 
Liability) Act 1959 (Cth), which effectively created a limitation period of two years. In this 
way the VCAT proceedings became a matter arising under a law of the Commonwealth 
Parliament, thus answering the description in s 76(ii).  

A further possibility is that a State tribunal might hear a matter to which the Commonwealth 
is a party, bringing it within the description in s 75(iii). An example is Commonwealth  
v Anti-Discrimination Tribunal.25 A man visited a Centrelink office in Hobart and was told he 
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had no alternative but to stand in a queue if he wished to consult a staff member — this 
despite the physical discomfort he was experiencing due to a medical condition. He 
commenced proceedings in Tasmania’s Anti-Discrimination Tribunal, claiming to have 
experienced discrimination on the ground of disability. The other party was Centrelink, a 
Commonwealth agency, bringing this matter within the scope of s 75(iii). 

Perhaps surprisingly, a State tribunal may find itself adjudicating a dispute involving the 
interpretation of the Constitution. This issue has arisen again in anti-discrimination 
proceedings, with persons against whom a complaint of vilification has been made arguing 
that the legislation making such vilification unlawful is in breach of the constitutional implied 
freedom of political communication.26 It is possible to imagine other instances of 
constitutional issues arising in tribunal proceedings: for example, it might be argued that a 
charge imposed by the State was an excise or that there had been an infringement of the 
freedom of interstate trade in s 92 of the Constitution or that State legislation was 
inconsistent with Commonwealth legislation under s 109.  

In short, there is much potential for ‘federal matters’ to come before State tribunals, often in 
unexpected ways. ‘Federal matters’ can arise across a wide range of powers and subject 
matters. As the submissions for the Attorney-General of Queensland, intervening in Burns  
v Corbett, pointed out:  

[T]he subject-matters in ss 75 and 76 are not discrete topics for adjudication and resolution … Rather, 
they cut across and may arise in potentially any topic for adjudication. State legislatures cannot avoid 
them when conferring judicial power on tribunals; they are a latent potentiality in the exercise of any 
judicial power in Australia.27  

Judicial power 

The Burns v Corbett limitation will only apply when a State tribunal is exercising judicial 
power. Tribunals are more commonly associated with the exercise of administrative power. 
But it is not uncommon for State tribunals to exercise judicial power. This is particularly 
common for civil and administrative tribunals, which often have substantial civil jurisdiction.  

The question of whether a decision-making power is ‘judicial power’ is one of the more 
conceptually contested questions in Australian constitutional law. Judicial power is a 
concept that seems ‘to defy, perhaps it were better to say transcend, purely abstract 
conceptual analysis’.28 Whether a power is ‘judicial’ turns on the analysis of a range of 
related features.29 This includes whether the power determines existing rights of the 
parties;30 involves the application of legal standards;31 is binding and authoritative;32 and is 
exercised in accordance with the judicial process.33 History is sometimes significant: the 
fact that a power that has been exercised by courts in the past supports a conclusion that 
the power is judicial power.34  

Moreover, the evaluative judgment involved in determining whether a particular function 
involves the exercise of judicial power is made more difficult by the recognition that there 
are some functions which may be performed in the exercise of either administrative or 
judicial power and which may ‘take their colour’ or character from the nature of the tribunal 
upon which they are conferred.35 This is most likely to be the case for functions that might, 
of their nature, be thought to be administrative but which are analogous to functions 
historically performed by courts,36 or to adjudicative powers which, when conferred on a 
court, will be conclusive and enforceable but which, when conferred on an administrative 
tribunal without the machinery for enforcement, can be characterised as not involving 
judicial power.37  
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Some jurisdictions conferred on civil and administrative tribunals appear readily to answer 
the description of ‘judicial power’. Residential tenancies disputes, small claims and 
consumer law matters, for example, generally involve resolving an inter partes dispute by 
application of the law to determine the parties’ existing legal rights, including  
under contract.38  

The enforceability of the tribunal’s decisions will at least sometimes be decisive. In Brandy 
v Human Rights and Equal Opportunity Commission,39 the arrangement under which a 
determination of the Tribunal could be registered in the Federal Court and thereby take 
effect as a judgment of the Court was the determinative factor marking the Tribunal out as 
exercising judicial power. Several State tribunals have a similar enforcement mechanism, 
indicating that these tribunals are likely to be found to exercise judicial power in at least 
some matters.40 

Other enforcement mechanisms may also indicate the existence of judicial power. In both 
New South Wales and South Australia, residential tenancies legislation provides for orders 
of the relevant tribunal to be enforced by a sheriff’s officer (in New South Wales)41 or bailiff 
(in South Australia).42 The power of the Tribunal to make orders terminating a residential 
tenancy agreement (in New South Wales) and for vacant possession (in South Australia) 
have been held to be judicial power.43 

A growing body of case law considers whether particular powers conferred on tribunals 
amount to judicial power. The power of the New South Wales Civil and Administrative 
Tribunal (NCAT) under the Residential Tenancies Act 2010 (NSW) to make an order for the 
termination of a residential tenancy has been held to be judicial power.44 So too has the 
power of the South Australian Civil and Administrative Tribunal (SACAT) to make an order 
for vacant possession of property upon the termination of a residential tenancy.45 While 
these cases may provide some guidance in analogous situations, the characterisation of a 
power as judicial or non-judicial will always necessitate a detailed examination of the nature 
of the specific power. In the wake of Burns v Corbett, a slew of litigation about whether key 
areas of tribunal jurisdiction involve judicial power appears inevitable.  

A court? 

The limitation identified in Burns v Corbett is only engaged if the tribunal is not a court. 
There is no prohibition on State courts exercising judicial power in federal matters. In the 
case of a State court, any jurisdiction exercised in such matters will, in fact, be federal 
jurisdiction by virtue of s 39 of the Judiciary Act 1903 (Cth).  

When is a tribunal a ‘court’? Some tribunals are established as courts. For example, s 164 
of the Queensland Civil and Administrative Tribunal Act 2009 (Qld) designates the 
Queensland Civil and Administrative Tribunal (QCAT) as a court of record. When the 
legislation creating a tribunal contains no such express provision, determining whether a 
body is a Ch III court involves the application of an evaluative, multi-factorial test. Some 
factors that have been considered in the authorities include whether the body is described, 
in legislation, as a ‘court’;46 the presence, or absence, of legislative designation as a ‘court 
of record’;47 whether the tribunal exercises judicial power or predominantly exercises 
judicial power;48 whether the tribunal is composed predominantly by judges;49 whether it is 
independent and impartial;50 whether it has powers traditionally possessed by courts;51 and 
whether it carries out its functions in a judicial manner.52 Whether all the members of the 
tribunal can properly be called ‘judges’ is often a particularly important factor53 and one 
closely intertwined with the question of independence and impartiality. The resolution of 
these questions may require examination of, inter alia, the manner in which tribunal 
members are appointed;54 whether members have Act of Settlement tenure;55 the length of 
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the term of appointment and possibility of renewal;56 whether members must be legally 
qualified;57 and the circumstances in which they may be removed from office.58 

This may often be a difficult evaluative judgment to make. This is illustrated by the 
conflicting decisions, in first half of 2018, on the issue of whether NCAT is a court. In 
Johnson v Dibbin,59 the Appeal Panel of NCAT held that NCAT is a court. But, in Zistis  
v Zistis,60 a single judge of the Supreme Court of New South Wales reached the opposite 
conclusion. In November 2018, the New South Wales Court of Appeal confirmed that 
NCAT is not a court.61  

The questions of whether tribunals exercise judicial power in particular instances, and 
whether a tribunal is a court, are complex and technical. But they are, happily, questions to 
which clear answers may be given in the fullness of time. We have already seen litigation 
on whether the residential tenancies jurisdictions of the South Australian62 and New South 
Wales63 civil and administrative tribunals involves the exercise of judicial power and 
whether the respective tribunals are courts. It may be that, after a flurry of litigation, the 
questions of judicial power and whether a tribunal is a court become settled — at least until 
State parliaments substantially amend the legislation establishing tribunals or confer new 
jurisdiction or powers on existing tribunals.  

Possible responses to Burns v Corbett 

The balance of this article considers how States might respond to Burns v Corbett in a way 
that preserves, to the greatest extent possible, the ability of State tribunals to deliver 
accessible, efficient justice. Seven design options are discussed. Several jurisdictions have 
already implemented some of these changes; these are also discussed in this section.  

Some of the redesign options would clearly avoid constitutional difficulty in future cases. 
But these options would involve some compromise in the ability of tribunals to perform their 
functions. Other redesign options suggested in this article raise some new constitutional 
questions but offer the States more flexibility in the operation of their tribunals. Elsewhere, 
Gabrielle Appleby and Anna Olijnyk have argued that, when governments are developing 
policy in areas of constitutional uncertainty, constitutional validity ought to be one factor in a 
holistic assessment of the risks and benefits of proposed legislation.64 Where genuine 
uncertainty about the constitutional position exists, a government should not necessarily 
adopt an option that is certain to be constitutionally valid if it does not meet the policy 
objectives. Governments should also consider options that pose a greater constitutional 
risk but better meet the needs of the community. The option that is chosen should be the 
outcome of a well-informed deliberative process that balances risks and benefits and 
considers available alternatives.  

Business as usual 

One possibility is for State tribunals to continue operating as they always have. That is, 
those State tribunals that currently exercise judicial power could continue to do so, 
accepting that, whenever a federal matter came before the tribunal, the tribunal would  
lack jurisdiction.  

This option has several drawbacks. The parties to federal matters would certainly be 
inconvenienced. They would have to find an alternative way of resolving their dispute: court 
proceedings (if Parliament has conferred relevant jurisdiction on a court), alternative 
dispute resolution, or taking no action. If a matter had been on foot for some time before it 
was identified as a federal matter, the parties and tribunal would have wasted resources on 
a matter that cannot be decided. There is also the potential for manipulation of the 
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tribunal’s jurisdiction. A party who wishes to avoid the tribunal’s jurisdiction may be able to 
convert a dispute into a federal matter by raising a non-colourable federal issue.65 Such a 
party could, for example, raise an arguable constitutional issue or invoke Commonwealth 
law. Those who avail themselves of this technique are likely to be those with access to 
legal advice — and, therefore, who are well-resourced. They are also more likely to be 
respondents (who wish to avoid a claim against them) than claimants (who have 
themselves invoked the tribunal’s jurisdiction).   

Express exception to jurisdiction 

As a variation on the ‘business as usual’ model, the jurisdiction of tribunals could be made 
subject to an express exception for federal matters. This could be achieved by inserting a 
provision into the legislation establishing the tribunal.  

This option would remove some of the inconvenience caused by Burns v Corbett by 
preventing matters that were, from their inception, obviously federal matters from 
proceeding before a non-judicial tribunal in the exercise of judicial power. The option has 
the advantage of alerting potential tribunal users to the limits of the tribunal’s jurisdiction 
before proceedings are commenced. But, of course, not all tribunal users will read the 
legislation. In practice, the burden of identifying federal matters might fall on registry staff 
(to the extent that the federal nature of the matter is apparent from the originating 
documents) or on tribunal members. 

Moreover, like the first option, this approach leaves open the possibility that a matter may 
progress for some time before it is identified as a federal matter. For example, a party might 
not raise an issue arising under the Constitution or under Commonwealth law until the 
issues in the dispute had been fleshed out through the early stages of tribunal proceedings. 
This will create considerable inconvenience in these matters.  

Clearly, there are practical difficulties with the first two options. However, some State 
governments may form the view that these difficulties are a reasonable price to pay for 
preserving a tribunal system that is functioning effectively in its current form.  

No judicial power for tribunals 

States could completely avoid the Burns v Corbett problem by ensuring that their tribunals 
do not exercise judicial power. There is no impediment to a non-judicial body determining a 
federal matter in the exercise of non-judicial power. This solution, therefore, would have the 
advantage of certainty and clarity. There would be no need to sift federal from non-federal 
matters; no part-heard proceedings would have to be abandoned.  

There is some policy downside to this option. It deprives tribunal users of a binding, 
authoritative decision that can be enforced using the machinery of judicial power. There are 
some areas of tribunal jurisdiction in which the enforceability of decisions is critical to their 
utility. In a residential tenancies matter where a landlord seeks vacant possession, for 
example, anything short of an immediately enforceable decision made in the exercise of 
judicial power may be insufficient.  

It may not always be easy to determine whether a power is judicial or non-judicial. While 
the nature of enforcement mechanisms will be decisive in some cases, in others it will be 
less relevant. The question of whether a power is judicial is not susceptible of a universal 
answer in respect of all powers conferred on a particular tribunal. It is necessary to 
consider whether each power or jurisdiction involves the exercise of judicial power. This is 
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the case both for powers already conferred on tribunals and for any powers States may 
wish to confer on their tribunals in future.  

Therefore, while the solution of conferring only non-judicial power on tribunals is relatively 
attractive and apparently neat, it brings its own uncertainty and practical difficulties.  

Tribunals as courts 

There is a second way of avoiding the fragmentation of proceedings that might be caused 
by Burns v Corbett: turning State tribunals into courts for the purposes of Ch III of the 
Constitution. As noted above, some State tribunals are already courts. Turning tribunals 
into courts would mean they could continue to exercise judicial power, even in federal 
matters. There is, of course, no constitutional prohibition on State courts exercising judicial 
power in federal matters. On the contrary: ss 71 and 77(iii) of the Constitution contemplate 
the exercise of federal jurisdiction by State courts. Section 39 of the Judiciary Act 1903 
(Cth) vests all State courts with jurisdiction in federal matters (with limited exceptions).  

There is a further consequence of being a State court which may be regarded as desirable 
in some respects but less convenient for State governments and legislatures. State courts 
are subject to the so-called Kable principle.66 This principle prohibits State legislatures from 
substantially impairing the ‘institutional integrity’ of State courts.67 The High Court has 
applied the Kable principle to strike down laws authorising a court to order the ‘preventive’ 
detention of a named individual;68 requiring a court to make a control order against a 
person who was a member of a criminal organisation;69 relieving a judge, acting persona 
designata, from the obligation to give reasons for a decision;70 and requiring a court to hear 
certain applications ex parte on the application of the executive.71 Application of the Kable 
principle requires, in each case, a careful consideration of the legislative circumstances, 
and it is difficult to generalise about what will, or will not, infringe the principle.72 Relevant 
matters are likely to include the closeness of any connection between the executive and the 
court; any interference with the judicial process; and the extent to which the court retains its 
impartiality and independence.  

While a State tribunal might be a court for the purposes of Ch III, many of the features that 
make tribunals useful are distinctly un-court-like. Tribunals are, typically, designed to be 
more flexible and agile than courts. For example, tribunal members do not have the 
security of tenure enjoyed by judges. In many tribunals, members may be reappointed. 
Tribunal members are not necessarily legally educated; people from diverse sectors of the 
community make a valuable contribution to tribunal decision-making. Procedure in tribunals 
is generally less formal than in courts, and lawyers are often excluded, with many parties 
appearing in person. The functions conferred on tribunals are wide-ranging, some being 
purely administrative, with varying degrees of connection to the executive government.  

The existing case law makes it difficult to predict whether characteristics of this kind would, 
in particular circumstances, infringe the Kable principle. All that can be said with certainty is 
that there is uncertainty in this area. At the least, State governments who turn their tribunals 
into courts will need to exercise caution when conferring adventurous new powers on 
tribunals or when reforming the institutional features of tribunals.  

Federal matters to be referred to a State court 

The next two options in this article would allow State tribunals to continue exercising judicial 
power without being converted into courts.  
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The first of these is to have a mechanism for a federal matter in a non-judicial State tribunal 
to be transferred to a State court. Under this arrangement, applicants could still commence 
proceedings in a State tribunal, but, if it became apparent that a matter was a federal 
matter, it could be transferred to a court. Some jurisdictions already have provision for a 
matter to be transferred from a tribunal to a court.73  

Burns v Corbett has prompted other jurisdictions to create a mechanism specifically for 
federal matters to be transferred to courts. In New South Wales, a new Pt 3A was inserted 
into the Civil and Administrative Tribunal Act 2013 (NSW)74 allowing the District Court or 
Local Court, on application by a party, to hear a federal matter that has been commenced 
in the Tribunal. If the Court grants leave for the application to be made to the Court, the 
Court has all the functions and jurisdiction the Tribunal would have had if it could exercise 
jurisdiction in the matter,75 with certain exceptions that seem to be aimed at striking a 
balance between traditional standards of court procedure and the flexibility associated with 
tribunal proceedings. For example, the Local Court’s rules of practice and procedure 
generally apply to proceedings transferred from the Tribunal,76 but a person who is not a 
legal practitioner may represent a party in the Court if they would have been able to do so 
in the Tribunal;77 and the Court may choose not to apply the rules of evidence if they would 
not have been required to be applied in the Tribunal.78  

The Parliament of South Australia acted swiftly in the wake of Burns v Corbett (and a 
decision of SACAT applying Burns v Corbett)79 to introduce a similar mechanism. Under 
the new Pt 3A of the South Australian Civil and Administrative Tribunal Act 2013 (SA),80 the 
Tribunal may order that proceedings be transferred to the Magistrates Court if the Tribunal 
considers that ‘it does not have, or there is some doubt as to whether it has, jurisdiction to 
determine the application because its determination may involve the exercise of’ the 
jurisdiction referred to in s 75(iii) or (iv) of the Constitution:81 that is, diversity jurisdiction or 
matters in which the Commonwealth is a party. As in New South Wales, the Court has all 
the powers and functions the Tribunal would have had.82 While the New South Wales 
legislation leaves procedure to be governed largely by the Court rules, the South Australian 
model provides that the Court is to follow the procedures that would have been applicable 
in the Tribunal, unless the Court determines otherwise.83 These legislative changes are to 
be supplemented by the appointment of a Tribunal member as an auxiliary magistrate, with 
the intention that proceedings transferred from SACAT to the Magistrates Court will be 
heard by this auxiliary magistrate at SACAT’s premises, thus minimising the disruption for 
the parties.84 

Such arrangements for transferring proceedings from a tribunal to a court allow tribunals to 
continue exercising judicial power in non-federal matters. As with the options outlined 
above, they may create some fragmentation of proceedings if a matter has proceeded for 
some time before the federal element is identified. However, the procedure for transferring 
from a tribunal to a court is likely simpler than the ‘business as usual’ alternative, which 
would require the parties in a federal matter to abandon tribunal proceedings and file a 
fresh application in a court of competent jurisdiction.  

There remains room for different views about the best design for these mechanisms. For 
example, Gabrielle Appleby has argued that the New South Wales model inappropriately 
places the onus of determining whether federal matters are engaged, and whether to apply 
to a court, on the applicant.85 From this perspective, the South Australian model may be 
thought preferable because it gives the Tribunal the power and discretion to decide when to 
transfer proceedings. On the other hand, the South Australian legislation applies only to 
matters falling within s 75(iii) and (iv) of the Constitution, leaving no recourse for the 
(admittedly rare, but hardly unforeseeable) matters within other classes of jurisdiction 
described in ss 75 and 76 that may come before the Tribunal.  
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An exception to judicial power 

Legislation conferring judicial power on a State tribunal could provide that, in federal 
matters, the tribunal could only exercise non-judicial power. Alternatively, this could be 
achieved through a provision in the legislation establishing the tribunal. Under this option, 
the tribunal could exercise judicial power in most matters. But, if it became apparent that a 
matter was a federal matter, the tribunal would switch to exercising non-judicial power. This 
would potentially mean the tribunal could still determine federal matters, just not in the 
exercise of judicial power. It would therefore avoid the inconvenience and fragmentation 
associated with some of the other options discussed in this article. 

However, this may be easier said than done. As explained earlier, it is not always easy to 
determine whether a particular power conferred on a tribunal is judicial power, so there may 
not be a failsafe way of rendering a power non-judicial.  

In some cases, provision for the order of a tribunal to be registered in a court will be 
determinative of the question of judicial power.86 In such instances, it would be relatively 
simple to provide that registration is not available in federal matters. This would mean that 
the tribunal could decide federal and non-federal matters in substantially the same way. 
The tribunal’s orders in non-federal matters could, upon registration, be enforced as orders 
of a court; orders in federal matters could not be so enforced. Conceptually, this solution is 
not entirely satisfactory and raises further questions: can a single provision really 
simultaneously confer both judicial and non-judicial power on a tribunal? Moreover, the 
solution may create practical difficulties if a matter is not identified as a federal matter until 
after the tribunal has made an order. Has the tribunal already (purportedly) exercised 
judicial power, making the order invalid?  

Could the Burns v Corbett problem be fixed by the consent of the parties? Of course, 
parties to a matter could not consent to the tribunal acting unconstitutionally. But, if it 
became apparent that a federal matter had arisen and the tribunal lacked jurisdiction, could 
the parties agree between themselves to be bound by the tribunal’s decision? The 
tribunal’s decision would then derive its legal force from the agreement of the parties rather 
than from sovereign authority and would thus, at least arguably, not be an exercise of 
judicial power.87 The tribunal would, in such cases, effectively act as an arbitrator. This 
solution would enable part-heard proceedings to continue smoothly. But, again, this 
solution is not foolproof. A respondent who did not wish to be subject to a potential adverse 
decision might decline to assent to being bound by the tribunal’s decision. It is possible that 
a court would view the ‘agreement’ of the parties as a charade to mask a real exercise of 
judicial power. The reality of the consent of the parties may also be open to question, 
especially if a party was self-represented. Can such a party be taken to understand  
the consequences of agreeing to abide by the decision of a ‘tribunal’, now acting as a 
private adjudicator?  

Hybrid tribunal 

The option of carving out an exception to judicial power of federal matters would allow 
State tribunals to determine federal matters but not in the exercise of judicial power. The 
final option outlined in this article would allow State tribunals to exercise judicial power in 
federal matters and would also preserve much of the institutional flexibility tribunals enjoy 
when they are not courts.  

This solution requires a tribunal to comprise two parts: a ‘judicial section’ that is a Ch III 
court; and a ‘non-judicial section’ that is not a court. This structure is not unprecedented. 
Until 2016, the New South Wales Industrial Commission could sit in Court Session as the 
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Industrial Court of New South Wales.88 South Australia’s recently established South 
Australian Employment Tribunal has a similar structure.89 Under both of these models, 
judicial power was conferred on the tribunal in court session, while the non-judicial section 
of the tribunal exercised only non-judicial power.  

This structure could potentially be adapted to overcome some of the difficulties States face 
after Burns v Corbett. The non-judicial section of the tribunal could exercise judicial power; 
there is no general prohibition on the exercise of judicial power by State tribunals. But if a 
federal matter arose in the non-judicial section of the tribunal, the matter could be 
transferred to the judicial section of the tribunal.  

This solution has already been adopted in the South Australian Employment Tribunal, in 
legislation introduced after Burns v Corbett.90 Under a new s 6AB of the South Australian 
Employment Tribunal Act 2014 (SA), the South Australian Employment Court (that is, in 
effect, the judicial division of the institution) must hear proceedings that involve, or that the 
Tribunal considers may involve, the exercise of the jurisdiction described in s 75(iii) and (iv) 
of the Constitution (diversity jurisdiction and matters in which the Commonwealth is a 
party). If proceedings are referred to the Court by the Tribunal when already underway, 
steps taken in the Tribunal are treated as if they had been taken in the Court.91  

A practical advantage of this option is that, if a matter is part-heard before it becomes 
apparent that it is a federal matter, the tribunal could be reconstituted as the judicial 
section. The legislation creating the tribunal could provide for evidence or other material 
already before the tribunal to be treated as being before the judicial section in this situation. 
If the member who had been hearing the matter was also a member of the judicial section, 
the hearing could continue with minimal disruption.   

This structure would have further practical advantages in that the judicial and non-judicial 
sections of the tribunal could share premises, infrastructure and staff. There could be 
substantial overlap in the membership of the judicial and non-judicial sections. Members 
with a suitable level of legal experience and/or status — and, perhaps, a higher level of 
statutory independence — could be members of both sections. The non-judicial section 
could also include members who brought valuable non-legal attributes to the tribunal and 
members appointed on more flexible conditions.  

However, these kinds of ‘hybrid’ tribunals are not without their own difficulties. For example, 
it may often be difficult for parties, or even tribunal members themselves, to be certain what 
part of the tribunal is hearing a particular matter. Experience suggests that, in practice, this 
question may not be addressed at all until it becomes apparent that the answer is 
important. At that point the potential benefits of enabling a tribunal to act either as an 
administrative tribunal or as a court may have been lost if the matter was in fact heard by 
the wrong part of the tribunal or if the issue is one that may itself be the subject of doubt 
and dispute. 

This proposal is relatively novel. Guidance on the design of such a tribunal can be drawn 
from the New South Wales and South Australian examples, but the answers to several 
practical and constitutional questions remain uncertain.  

First, a practical question: who would be responsible for identifying federal matters? One of 
the great advantages of tribunals over courts is that it is usually possible for individuals to 
present their case effectively without legal assistance. It seems unlikely that many 
unrepresented parties will be aware of the constitutional limits on a tribunal’s jurisdiction. 
This would place the onus on the tribunal to identify federal matters. What follows is an 
initial outline of how the process might work.  
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Applicants could simply file their application in the tribunal, without nominating whether the 
matter was to be heard by the judicial or the non-judicial section. An initial check could be 
performed by registry staff to see whether the matter is a federal matter. In some cases, 
this will be apparent from the initiating documents — for example, whether the parties are 
residents of different States or whether one or more of the parties is a State or 
Commonwealth government entity. Registry staff would then allocate the matter to either 
the non-judicial section or (if the matter had been identified as a federal matter) to the 
judicial section. The tribunal member before whom each new matter came could then 
perform an additional check and, if necessary, transfer the matter to the judicial section at 
that stage. The tribunal member would need to remain alert to the possibility of a federal 
matter arising when the matter was part-heard. Undoubtedly, this system would place an 
extra burden on tribunal members and staff; this is something for State governments to 
consider when crafting a response to Burns v Corbett. But this is simply an aspect of the 
‘first duty’ of any tribunal to satisfy itself that it has jurisdiction. 

Now for some of the constitutional questions that this institutional arrangement might raise.  

If a part-heard matter was reallocated to the judicial section of the tribunal, could any 
evidence before the non-judicial section be treated as evidence before the judicial section, 
without any further procedure? This would amount to outsourcing a large part of the  
fact-finding function to a non-judicial body. Would this infringe the Kable principle? Could 
any problems be cured by making the consent of the parties a precondition to the transfer 
of a matter to the judicial section? If so, could this be exploited by a party who wished to 
avoid the tribunal’s jurisdiction?  

For the purposes of the Kable principle, can the judicial section of a tribunal be insulated 
from the non-judicial section? Are the institutional characteristics of, or functions conferred 
on, the non-judicial section capable of affecting the institutional integrity of the judicial 
section?92 If this is the case, does the State lose the advantage of flexibility in the  
non-judicial section — in which case, why not just make the whole tribunal a court?  

We do not know the answers to these questions. Because the arrangement is novel, so too 
are the constitutional questions.  

Conclusion 

Burns v Corbett clarified the limits on the States’ power to confer judicial power in federal 
matters on their non-judicial tribunals. But the application of this constitutional limit raises 
many fresh questions, the answers to which are unclear. Litigation in each State will give us 
the answers to some questions: which tribunals are ‘courts’? Which jurisdictions involve the 
exercise of judicial power?  

Meanwhile, State governments must work to develop responses to Burns v Corbett. This 
article has suggested a range of options for reform. These options could be placed along a 
spectrum from the constitutionally conservative (such as turning all State tribunals into 
courts) to the constitutionally adventurous (such as the split-tribunal idea). But the reform 
options must also be evaluated by reference to their operational efficacy and 
responsiveness to the needs of the community. It is for each State to weigh its appetite for 
constitutional risk against the desirability of particular policy goals.  
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